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Most of the words and vocabularies recorded in this book pertaining to
each subject, one or two were experiences of my own, and the rest

those of boys and girls who were school mates of mine from Primary to
University level of education.

From my own learning experience no students, parent or even a guardian
who feels good comfortable to see his son or daughter failing in his or her
examinations but rather they all feel good when their children are showing
positivity in class room test, end of month examinations, mid­term
examinations, annual examinations and even National examinations, good
performance in schools that is the goal of both parents and students.

There is no point in beginning something without ambition. In so many
aspects of my life I have held to that notion, and it has led to more than one
fiery crash through the years. In my learning journey I still recall, with
bitterness and sweetness that I gained in trying to prove my positive
academic performance while at school.

Sometimes I failed and sometimes I passed with shinning marks, same
applied to my school mates. Passing with flying colors was our first priority
but failing was not supposed to be mentioned only because we never
prayed for that, though sometimes we kept on failing.

Foreword
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Vocabularies used to frame questions and examination techniques in
attending those questions are what led us to failing those examinations, it is
not that we were not smart but vocabularies used were smarter than us.
Same applies to your child he or she is not failing because they are
tabularasas “No” but he or she is failing because of the vocabularies used in
framing such examinations.

I wrote this Subject Dictionary so as to help your child create them with
knowledge on how to tackle and understand the vocabularies which are
being used by teachers in framing examinations, but also to create your
child with the confidence in attending and facing different examinations. Not
only that but also this book will help either a guardian or parent while
helping their children while attending home works or different academic
works while at home.

I hope this book will be of use to you

Baraka A. Mwenisongole, 2022
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CHAPTER 1

CIVIC AND MORAL ­ URAIA NA MAADILI

NO

1.
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WORD

Abroad

Ambassador

Attorney general

AU

Basic needs

Behavior

Benefits

Bill of rights

Boundaries

Bride price (dowry)

Census

KISWAHILI

Ughaibuni

Balozi

Jaji mkuu

Umoja wa Afrika

Mahitaji muhimu

Tabia

Mafanikio au faida

Muswada wa haki

Mipaka

Mahari

Sensa
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Ceremony

Chaos

Child labour

Citizen

Citizenship

Civilization

Community

Constitution

Consumption

Corruption

Counseling

Country

Court

Courtship

Culture

Customs

Decision making

Development

Disabled people

Sherehe

Machafuko

Ajira kwa watoto

Raia

Uraia

Ustaarabu

Jamii

Katiba

Ulaji / matumizi

Rushwa

Nasaha

Nchi

Mahakama

Uchumba

Utamaduni

Desturi

Maamuzi

Maendeleo

Watu wasiojiweza
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